. Ingredient Est Annual Unit Vendor Awarded Manufacturer Manufacturer Pack Size | Unit Size | Cost Per Case S.ervlngs or Extended Bid Price
Line # |CATEGORY Usage Product Code Units Per Case
1 GRAINS WG Blueberry Muffin 2 Grain 100,000 Each Danielsens Buena Vista 60326 120 30z 51.35 120 5,134.99]
2 GRAINS WG Breakfast Bar - Low Sugar 80,000 each Dani Quaker 31182 96 840z 26.05 96 21,708.33
Cor.n or WG F\ourT(J.nlllas (Each tortilla should 200,000 Each . .
3 GRAINS weigh 28 grams minimum) Danielsens Arranda's 7490 24 10ct 23.86 240 19,883.33]
4 GRAINS Pita Bread 50% Whole Wheat (Purchased) 17,000 Each Goldstar PAPAPITA BAKERY 5133 12 12CT 36.81 144 $4,345.63|
5 CANNED / DRY GOODS Cinnamon Toast Crunch Cereal Bar 50,000 each Sysco GENERAL MILLS 45576000 96 1.420Z 26.82 96 $13,968.75|
6 CANNED / DRY GOODS Golden Grahams Cereal Bar 50,000 each Sysco GENERAL MILLS 31913000 96 1.420Z 26.82 96 $13,968.75)
7 CANNED / DRY GOODS Apple Cinnimon Cereal Bar 50,000 each Danielsens Kellogg's 59779 96 1.550z 32.30 96 16,822.91
8 CANNED / DRY GOODS Salsa 200 Gallons D Our House H6013 6 #10 2135 60 711.66
9 CANNED / DRY GOODS Hot Sauce PC's (Tapatio, Cholula, or 25,000 Each Danielsens Tapatio 500193 500 7gm 37.50 500 1,875.00
10 CANNED / DRY GOODS Tomato Paste 225 #10 Can D Our House H6141 6 #10 27.48 60 1,030.50]
11 CANNED / DRY GOODS White Vinegar 25 Gallons Sysco MIZKAN AMERICAS INC 10074865106976 4 1GAL 12.18 4 $76.13
12 CANNED / DRY GOODS Ketchup (No HFCS) 750 #10 Can Dani Simply Heinz 622560 6 #10 34.68 60 4,335.00
13 CANNED / DRY GOODS Brown Sugar 750 # Danielsens Packers - — 1 25lb 21.66 25 649.8
14 CANNED / DRY GOODS Honey 125 Gallons Sysco BARKMAN HONEY LLC PF4107 6 5LB 131.55 30 $4,573.56|
Corn Bread Mix (Purchased, Must be 50% Cornmeal
and All Purpose Flour must be unbleached & 1,400 #
15 CANNED / DRY GOODS enriched) Sysco CONTINENTAL MILLS 734-0580 6 5LB 36.03 30 $1,681.40]
16 CANNED / DRY GOODS Cornmeal 1,400 # Danielsens Pioneer 41122 1 25Ib 13.42 25 751.52
17 (CANNED / DRY GOODS All Purpose Flour (Unbleached, Unbromated, and 1,500 # Goldstar GOLD MEDAL 14439 1 50LB 25.11 50 $753.30]
18 CANNED / DRY GOODS Canola Oil 400 Gallons Danielsens Crisco 16948 4 1gal 40.00 4 4,000.00]
19 (CANNED / DRY GOODS Whole Plum Tomatoes (Canned, Alta Cucina brand) 3,500 #10 Can Sysco EUROPEAN IMPORTS LTD DNPO11 6 104 38.30 60 $2,234.17]
20 |CANNED /DRY GOODS Olive Oil 10 Gallons Sysco SOVENA USA INC 210602 4 1GAL 51.19 4 $5,119.00
21 (CANNED / DRY GOODS Lemon Juice (Real Lemon, Shelf Stable) 200 Quarts Dani Ambrosia 32012 12 320z 21.54 24 359
22 CANNED / DRY GOODS Sugar 300 # Danielsens CNH 814602 1 50lb 34.44 50 206.64
23 CANNED / DRY GOODS Brown Rice PARBOILED (Uncle Ben's) 8,857 # D Riceland 26225 1 25Ib 14.03 25 4,970.54
24 |CANNED / DRY GOODS Marinara (Purchased) 4,300] #10Can  |Sysco CONAGRA GROCERY 2700039125 6 104 43.05 60 $3,085.25
25 CANNED / DRY GOODS WG Rotini 3,900 # Dani Dakota Growers 92021 2 10lb 19.05 20 3,714.75
26 CANNED / DRY GOODS WG Penne Pasta 2,100 # Danielsens Dakota Growers 92010 2 10lb 19.05 20 2,000.25|
27 CANNED / DRY GOODS WG ELBOW MACARONI 5,674 # D Dakota Growers 92109 2 10lb 19.05 20 5,404.48
28 CANNED / DRY GOODS WG SPAGHETTI NOODLES 19,000 # Danielsens Dakota Growers 91322 2 10lb 19.05 20 18,097.50]
29 CANNED / DRY GOODS Lentils (Brown) 1,100 # Sysco TRINIDAD BENHAM LEN10201SY 1 20LB 20.96 20 $1,152.80]
30 CANNED / DRY GOODS Rice Vinegar 110 Quarts Goldstar KIKKOMAN INTERNATIONAL 2020 4 1GL 3443 4 $236.71
31 (CANNED / DRY GOODS Soy Sauce, Lite (Low Sodium) 200 Quarts Sysco KIKKOMAN INTL 130 6 .5 GAL 38.68 3 $63.62
32 CANNED / DRY GOODS Pinto Beans, Canned, Low Sodium 2,100 #10 Can Danielsens Aunt Penny's 39300 6 #10 cans 23.08 60 8,078.00
33 CANNED / DRY GOODS Pinto Beans, Dried, Low Sodium 715 # Goldstar PEAK 189664100 1 25LB 27.27 25 $779.93
34 CANNED / DRY GOODS Black Beans (Canned) Low Sodium 201 #10Can Danielsens Aunt Penny's 39200 6 #10 cans 23.60 60 790.6}
35 CANNED / DRY GOODS Canned Mixed Beans (Black, Kidney, Pinto) Low 2,700 Cans Sysco BEAN KIDNEY DK RED 9254608 12 15.5 0Z 13.38 12
36 CANNED / DRY GOODS Hot Sauce Bulk (Tapatio, Cholua, or Valentina) 50 Quarts Danielsens Tapatio 892027 12 320z 50.18 24 209.09
37 CANNED / DRY GOODS Lime Juice, Shelf Stable, Real Lime 800 Quarts D li 90963 4 lgal 51.12 33 2,556.00]
38 CANNED / DRY GOODS Soy Milk 20 Quarts Goldstar KIKKOMAN INTERNATIONAL 6136 12 320z 27.59 24 $45.99
39 (CANNED / DRY GOODS Red Enchilada Sauce (Purchased) 1,100 Quarts Goldstar LAS PALMAS 359374/11050 6 #10 42.85 60 $2,285.34)
40 CANNED / DRY GOODS Mayonaise 500 Gallons NO AWARD
41 (CANNED / DRY GOODS Worchestershire Sauce 691 Cups Dani French's 30804 4 1gal 36.14 4 390.2
42 CANNED / DRY GOODS Red Wine Vinegar 12 Gallons Danielsens Rich and All 3604525 4 lgal 24.99 4 74397
43 CANNED / DRY GOODS Raisins 225 # Goldstar BOGHOSIAN 21610 1 30LB 56.97 30 $427.28
44 CANNED / DRY GOODS Croutons Vegan 800 # NO AWARD
45 CANNED / DRY GOODS TERRIYAKI SAUCE 1,913 POUNDS |NO AWARD
46 |CANNED / DRY GOODS LOW SUGAR GRANOLA 4,144] POUNDS |Goldstar GENERAL MILLS 11987 4 500z 48.99 13 $16,241.17|
47 CANNED / DRY GOODS WG CRACKERS 5,498 POUNDS [Sysco COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER 5640214 150 36.55 150 $0.00)
48  |CANNED / DRY GOODS BBQ DIPPING SAUCE (NO HFCS) 5,738] POUNDS |NO AWARD
49 CANNED / DRY GOODS BBQ SAUCE (NO HFCS) 1,594 POUNDS |NO AWARD
50 DAIRY Moz Cheese Stick 90,000 each Sysco GREAT LAKES CHEESE CO INC 99827 160 10z 34.32 160 $19,305.00|
51 DAIRY White Cheddar Shredded 2,250 # Sysco PACIFIC CHEESE CO INC 2907C4 4 5LB 65.25 20 $7,340.63]
52 DAIRY Plain Non Fat Yogurt (Greek) 3,000 # Danielsens Oikos 57735 6 3202z 2218 12 5,545.00]
53 DAIRY Butter (Unsalted) 1,100 # D Packers 800124 30 1lb 99.60 30 3,652.00
54 DAIRY Buttermilk FF 1,600 Quarts Sysco CRYSTAL CREAMERY INC 167482 6 .5 GAL 15.90 25 $2,120.00
55 DAIRY Butter Chicken Curry (Purchased) 12,416| Servings _ [Sysco SUKHI'S GOURMET INDIAN FO! 11-314S 2 5LB 63.48 10 $0.00)
56 DAIRY Parmesan Cheese (Grated) 1,150 # Danielsens Lake View 300011 4 51b 61.20 20 3,519.00]
57 DAIRY Queso Fresca 100 # Sysco MARQUEZ BROTHERS INTERNA 50214 1 121B 46.04 12 $383.67
58  |DAIRY American Cheese, White, Sliced 300 # Danielsens No Bid
59 DAIRY Sour Cream Bulk 300 # Sysco SAPUTO INC. 1003864 2 5LB 16.37 10 $491.10
60 DAIRY Feta Cheese 160 # Sysco SAPUTO CHEESE USA INC 7001523 2 5LB 34.18 10 $546.88
61 DAIRY LOW FAT PLAIN YOGURT 39,525 # Dani Dannon 5793 6 320z 14.11 12 46,474.81]
62 DAIRY SLICED CHEDDAR CHEESE 7,332] POUNDS |Sysco SCHREIBER FOODS INC STK28130 4 5LB 59.60 20 $894.00
63 FROZEN WG Mini-Bagel with Cream Cheese 90,000 each Dani Pillsbury Multiple 72 2430z 35.32 72 44,150.00)
64 FROZEN WG Pancakes (IW, Low Sugar) 30,000 each Goldstar KRUSTEAZ 80370 144 1.202 32.76 144 $6,825.00)
65 FROZEN WG Waffle (IW, Low Sugar) 30,000 each Sysco KELLOGG FOOD AWAY FROM H 3800024698 144 1.230Z 23.74 144 $4,945.83]
66 FROZEN Breakfast Burrito (IW) 40,000 each Danielsens Los Cabos 97891 72 2.95 0z 4273 72 23,738.88)
67 FROZEN Liquid Eggs 1,600 Quarts D Sunny Fresh 10081 12 21b 58.42 24 7,789.33
68 FROZEN Chickpea Meatball (Purchased, CN label or 3,000| Servings  |Sysco CONAGRA FROZEN FOODS 73473064134 1 10LB 41.42 10 $0.00]
69 FROZEN Spinach & Cheese Lasagna (Purchased, At least 1 Oz. 24,832 Servings __ [Sysco TASTY BRANDS LLC 00801WG 110 430z 94.40 110 $0.00)
70 FROZEN Cheese Quesadilla IW 6,000 each Sysco SCHWANS FOOD SERVICE 78373 1 96 CT 75.56 96 $4,722.50
71 FROZEN Vegan Lasagna (At least a 1 Oz. Grain & 2 Oz. M/MA) 5,845 Servings  [NO AWARD
72 FROZEN Chicken Teriyaki (Yangs) 24,832 Servings __[Danielsens Yangs 155548 40 21b 147.99 80 13,124.59]
73 FROZEN Teriyaki Sauce (Purchased) 30,677 Servings _ |Goldstar JT™M 73470 6 5LB 77.27 30 $4,938.36|
74 FROZEN Vegetable Fried Rice (Purchased, Minhs) 54,000 Servings |Danielsens Minh 69074 6 5.16 b 51.49 31 33,116.75)
75 FROZEN Tofu (Extra Firm) 4,800 # Sysco NASOYA FOODS USA LLC 140549 12 16 0Z 20.21 12 $505.25
76 FROZEN Tikka Masala Sauce (Purchased) 275 Gallons Sysco MONSOON KITCHENS INC 0 2 41B 29.67 8 $8,507.87|
77 FROZEN Orange Chicken (Purchased, Yangs) 7,035 Servings __[Danis Yang's 155555 6 4351b 143.43 261 5,255.36
78 FROZEN Orange Chicken Sauce (Purchased, Yang's) 8,040| Servings  [Sysco SCHWANS FOOD SERVICE 69143 5 6LB. 50.19 30 $0.00]
79 FROZEN Orange Juice 300 Gallons Sysco SUN ORCHARD LLC 7593 4 1 GAL 33.36 33 $2,502.00]
80 FROZEN Diced Sweet Potatoes (IQF) 260 # Sysco MOODY DUNBAR INC 20491603060315 6 #10 53.92 60 $233.65
81 FROZEN Chicken Enchiladas (Purchased IQF, 2 Oz. WG, 2 14,070 Servings Goldstar MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS 61954 141 202 85.79 141 $8,560.75
82 FROZEN Alfredo Sauce (Purchased ) 1 Oz. M/MA per serving 900 # Goldstar JT™ 5722 6 5LB 79.77 30 $2,393.10
83 FROZEN Shredded Pork (Purchased) 2,750 # Goldstar COMIDA VIDA 470505 5 6.7LB 90.64 34 $7,440.60)
84 FROZEN Sweet and Sour Chicken (Purchased) - Yangs 14,070| Servings _[Danielsens Yang's 155517 6 4351b 157.39 261 11,533.73]
85 FROZEN Sweet and Sour Sauce (Purchased) - Yangs 17,000 Servings  |Goldstar MINH 69142 5 6LB 62.64 30 $7,830.00]
86 FROZEN Chow Mein (Purchased) - Yangs 17,000 Servings [Danielsens Yang's 3016 1 14 1b 25.27 14 5,369.87|
87 FROZEN Chicken Shawarma (Purchased) 2 oz. M/MA per 15,000 Servings  [NO AWARD
88 FROZEN Falafel (Purchased) 2 oz. M/MA per serving 2,500| Servings  |Goldstar AMERICAN BEAN COMPANY 1002-24 1 2418 116.63 24 $2,351.42|
89 FROZEN Vegan Tamale (2 M/MA per serving) 25,000 each Goldstar MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY VBC11 72 6.360Z 77.71 72 $26,982.64]
90 FROZEN CHEESE PIZZA (Whole grain) 2 oz M/MA and 2 Grain 45,900 EACH Danielsens Tony's 78673 96 4.6 0z 53.75 96 25,699.21
91 FROZEN CHEESE RAVIOLI (TASTY BRANDS) 84,150] SERVINGS |[D: Tasty Brands 00804WG 108 3.78 0z 72.96 26 56,848.00
92 FROZEN BEAN & CHEESE BURRITO 45,900 EACH Danielsens Los Cabos 97576 96 520z 67.63 96 32,335.59
93 FROZEN FROZEN BERRIES 6,216] POUNDS [D: Inn Foods - 1 301b 48.33 30 10,013.97|
94 FROZEN CHEESE SAUCE 5,674 POUNDS [Danielsens Muy Fresco 31809 6 #10 44.77 60 6,390.56
95 FROZEN BEAN & RICE BURRITO 99,450 EACH D Cabo Primo 71883 64 6.55 oz 57.08 64 88,696.96
96 FROZEN EDAMAME 4,144 POUNDS _ |Sysco J.R. SIMPLOT CO. 10071179522768 6 2518 37.44 15 $10,343.42]
97 FROZEN CHEESE STICKS (BOSCOS) 45,900 EACH Sysco ARTISAN BREAD CO LLC 2011A 144 6" 65.93 144 $21,015.19)
98 FROZEN FROZEN MEATBALLS (2 0z M/MA per serving) 1,913 POUNDS |Sysco JTM PROVISIONS COMPANY IN 5035CE 6 5LB 97.19 30 $6,197.48
99 FROZEN HUMMUS 6,469 POUNDS [Sysco GRECIAN DELIGHT FOODS INC 9669151 4 3.75LB 45.66 15 $19,691.64]
100  |FROZEN TOFU CRUMBLES 6,311 POUNDS |Sysco WO CHONG CO INC 0 12 16 0Z 16.48 12 $433.36
101 |FROZEN CHICKEN POTSTICKERS (2 M/MA, 1 GRAIN PER 12,750 2 Goldstar O TASTY 44717 6 2.5LB 58.91 15 $12,518.38|
102 |FROZEN EDAMAME 1,594 POUNDS |Sysco J.R. SIMPLOT CO. 10071179522768 6 2518 37.44 15 $10,343.42]
103 [FROZEN Vegan Patty (Beyond Burger) 25,000 each Goldstar BEYOND MEAT 4880 64 30z 109.31 64 $42,699.22|
104 |FROZEN Vegan Nuggets (2 oz M/MA, Rebellyous) 500 # Danielsens Rebellyous KNFC212 265 6oz 38.44 10 1,922.00
105 [FROZEN Vegan Buffalo Wings (2 0z M/MA, Morningstar) 500 # Goldstar MORNINGSTAR (KELLOGGS) 28989-10407 240 .660Z 40.27 240 $2,033.84]
106 |MEAT Turkey Crumble 4,656 # Sysco BUTTERBALL LLC 2265570938 2 10LB 45.81 20 $15,996.85|




107 MEAT Ground Turkey 6,984 # D Sunland 97786 3 101b 45.60 30 10,615.10)
108 |MEAT Glazed Chicken Drumstick (2-2.5 M/MA Each, 50,000 Each Danielsens Tyson 26435 105 5.05 oz 90.16 33 42,933.33
109 MEAT Diced Chicken (Cooked) 6,000 # D Tyson 46012 1 101b 41.50 10 24,900.00
110 MEAT CHICKEN PATTY 2 oz. M/MA 45,900 EACH Danielsens Tyson 5809 52 3.190z 27.45 52 24,229.90|
111 MEAT CHICKEN BREAST FILLET STRIPS 2 Oz. M/MA per 7,651 POUNDS |Goldstar TYSON 10703320928 240 2.70Z 143.56 41 $27,120.44]
112 |MEAT CHICKEN THIGH FAJITA STRIPS 2 Oz M/MA per 5,738) POUNDS [Danielsens Tyson 46210 1 301b 11317 30 21,645.64]
113 MEAT HOT DOG 2 oz M/MA (FORK IN THE ROAD) 45,900 EACH Sysco FORK IN THE ROAD FOODS LLC 31327 80 20z 46.70 80 $1,071,765.00|
114 |MEAT BREADED CHICKEN STRIPS 2 Oz. M/MA per serving 5,738 POUNDS |[Goldstar TYSON 10703340928 4 7.965L8 98.23 32 $17,691.27]
115 MEAT CHICKEN LEG 2 oz M/MA per serving 12,750] CHICKEN LEG |Sysco TYSON FOODS POULTRY 10086340928 1 40 1B 31.30 40 $9,976.88]
116 |MEAT Beef Patty - 2 0z M/MA per serving 81,000 Each Sysco DON LEE CNQ162253 240 2.250z 67.78 240 $22,875.75)
117 |MEAT Chicken Patty - 2 0z M/MA per serving 37,990 Each Dani Tyson 5809 52 3.19 0z 27.45 52 20,054.33)
118 |MEAT Boneless Chicken Buffalo Wings - 2 0oz M/MA per 6,208| # Sysco TYSON FOODS POULTRY 10703620928 4 7.51B 117.69 30 $24,353.98
MARKET BASKET BID ITEMS
Line # |CATEGORY Ingredient Est Annual Unit Vender Awarded Manufacturer Manufactu | Pack Size Unit Size Cost Per Case | Extended Bid Price

119 [SPICES Taco Seasoning Mix 150 # Daniel Tampico 90085 1 25 Ib 104.26 625.56)
120 [SPICES Dry Guajillo Chiles 50 # D Tampico 80262 1 61b 27.33 227.65
121 [SPICES Ground Oregano 45 # D l Tampico 80071 1 10 oz 5.36 385.92
122 [SPICES Ground Cumin 140 # D Tampico 80042 1 51b 21.67 606.76)
123 [SPICES Granulated Garlic 90 # D l Tampico 80162 1 71b 42.79 550.15
124 [SPICES Dijon Mustard (Ground not Whole Grain Dijon) 36| Gallons D: No Bid

125  [SPICES Kosher Salt (Diamond Crystal) 400 # D l Diamond Crystal 22002 12 41b 75.77 631.41
126 SPICES Baking Soda 30 # D Hearth Club 750 24 1lb 17.19 21.48
127 [SPICES Baking Powder (Double Acting) 75 # D l Chef's Compani 58001 6 51b 70.38 175.95
128  [SPICES Ground Turmeric 85 # D Tampico 80105 1 1lb 5.83 495.55
129 [SPICES Garam Masala 125 # D l Tampico 80362 1 6lb 25.98 541.25
130  [SPICES Cinnamon Stick 3,050 Each D No Bid

131 [SPICES Ground Fennel 5 # Daniel No Bid

132 [SPICES Ground Thyme 4 # D Tampico 80101 1 12 0z 4.45 23.73
133 [SPICES Bay Leaf 200 Each D | No Bid

134 |SPICES Paprika 20 # D Tampico 80146 1 51b 18.3 73.2
135 [SPICES Cayenne Pepper 4 # D l Tampico 80151 1 1lb 5.36 21.44
136 [SPICES Ground Allspice 4 # D Tampico 80001 1 1lb 8.14 32.56
137 |SPICES Ginger, ground 15 # D l Tampico 80053 1 1lb 8.16 122.4
138 SPICES Cornstarch 60 # D Argo 2001566 1 251b 19.74 47.37]
139 |SPICES Chili Powder 130 # D I Tampico 80296 1 51b 19.42 504.92
140 [SPICES Onion Powder 10 # D Tampico 80159 1 1lb 5.27 52.7
141 [SPICES Black Pepper 15 # D l Tampico 80218 1 51b 29.53 88.59
142 [SPICES Mustard, Ground 10 # D Tampico 80064 1 51b 16.09 32.18]
143 |SPICES Crushed Red Pepper Flake 5 # D l Tampico 80153 1 10 0z 4.15 33.2




